FACCH\WRDA10\COMPILED_WRDA_002.XML

1
2
3
4
5
6
7
8
9

10
11
12
13
14
15
16
17
18
19
20
21
22
23
24
25
26

45
SEC. 3027. HOCKING RIVER BASIN, MONDAY CREEK, OHIO.

Section 1001(37)(B)(111) of the Water Resources De-
velopment Act of 2007 (121 Stat. 1055) is amended by
striking “$1,270,000” and inserting “$12,000,000".

SEC. 3028. LOWER COLUMBIA RIVER AND TILLAMOOK BAY
ECOSYSTEM RESTORATION, OREGON AND
WASHINGTON.

Section 536(g) of the Water Resources Development
Act of 2000 (114 Stat. 2662) is amended by striking
“$30,000,000” and inserting “$45,000,000”.

SEC. 3029. CORPUS CHRISTI SHIP CHANNEL, CORPUS
CHRISTI, TEXAS.

The project for navigation and ecosystem restoration,
Corpus Christi Ship Channel, Texas, authorized by section
1001(40) of the Water Resources Development Act of
2007 (121 Stat. 1056) 1s modified to authorize the Sec-
retary to construct the project at a total cost of
$447,604,000, with an estimated Federal cost of
$183,827,000 and an estimated non-Federal cost of
$263,777,000.

SEC. 3030. DALLAS FLOODWAY, DALLAS, TEXAS.

The project for flood control, Trinity River and tribu-
taries, Texas, authorized by section 2 of the Act entitled
“An Act authorizing the construction, repair, and preser-
vation of certain public works on rivers and harbors, and

for other purposes”, approved March 2, 1945, and modi-

f\VHLC\072810\072810.179.xml (47513214)
July 28, 2010 (12:48 p.m.)



